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Two moms file lawsuit against city, union 

Mothers say strike is harmful to children
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Toronto's municipal workers' strike is causing "irreparable harm" to children and youth who have been robbed of 
summer camps, child care, summer jobs and recreation, say two mothers who have launched legal action against the 
city and one of its two striking unions.

In their application to be heard by the Ontario Superior Court on July 31, the mothers, identified only as A.B. and 
E.F., say the loss of these programs violates the Canadian Charter of Rights and Freedoms.

And until this constitutional challenge can be properly argued, they are calling on the court to order the city and 
striking child- care and recreation staff to restore these services immediately.

The legal action, believed to be the first of its kind in a Canadian labour dispute, is challenging the constitutionality 
of Ontario's Labour Relations Act for not considering the interests of children during the strike, said lawyer Jeffery 
Wilson, who is representing the mothers and their children.

"The legislation is silent on children and there is no evidence that either side properly considered the impact of the 
strike on the interests or needs of children or families' ability to manage during the summer months," he said in an 
interview.

Neither the city nor the Canadian Union of Public Employees Local 79, which represents the city's recreation and 
child care staff, would comment directly on the legal action.

Of the 3,000 municipal daycare spaces affected by the strike, 88 per cent are subsidized. In its 2007 annual report, 
Toronto Parks, Forestry and Recreation said there were more than 86,000 registrations for summer and March Break 
camps at 243 locations (with many kids registered multiple times for different sessions.)

Single mother A.B. said her 10-year-old autistic son was eagerly awaiting the chance to participate in city tennis and 
drama camps this summer. 

The loss of those affordable programs that offered one-on-one aid to her special needs child has been devastating, 
she said.

"I do not have the resources to fund his placement in a private camp or other such organization," she said in her 
affidavit.

Single mother E.F. said the strike means her children, aged 6 and 15, "are doing nothing" this summer.

"My 15-year-old son I.J. has lost the opportunity for participation in a youth program," she says in her affidavit. 
"This is leading him to engage in other less suitable activities, with a risk of inappropriate conduct." 

At least eight mental health workers, psychiatrists, social workers and children's advocates have filed affidavits 
supporting the mothers' claim that the strike is causing serious harm to Toronto's kids.

Ruth daCosta, executive director of Covenant House shelter for homeless youth, said her vulnerable clients have lost 
important job opportunities and a chance to participate in healthy recreational activities because of the cancellation 
of city programs.

Child psychotherapist Frances Oliver said the current tough economic climate is making it even more difficult for 
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families who rely on affordable city programs.

"The children feel that and it creates a lot of anxiety," she said. 

"One senses the restlessness amongst youth without any structure or programs may be more impactful than the stink 
and toxicity of lingering garbage dumps," she added.


